
Computer Projectors 8-2003
Non-Compliant to Specification

 Winning Lowest Responsive Vendor

Item Desc Qt
Auto Pick 

LOW Item Awarded to: ea line
1 Epson 7800 Each unit  to include: ELPLL05 middle 

throw lens (2) Additional Spare Lamps
5

4,336.00 None 0.00
2 Mitsubishi XL30 Each unit  to include:  (2) Additional 

Spare Lamps
5

3,672.00 AGS 3,672.00 18,360.00
3 Sharp   XG-P25X Each unit  to include:  (2) Additional 

Spare Lamps
5

4,454.00 None 0.00
4 Epson 8300i Each unit  to include: Lens capable of 

projecting an image 16' wide from 50 feet. (2) 
Additional Spare Lamps

1

10,281.00 None 0.00
5 Mitsubishi XL5950 Each unit  to include: Lens 

capable of projecting an image 16' wide from 50 feet. 
(2) Additional Spare Lamps

1

7,566.00 AGS 7,566.00 7,566.00



Company ATV Video Center Company AV Center Company Snader & Assoc
Name Jon Bryant Name John Rodakowski Name Ron Kawata
Phone # 888 973-9149 Phone # 888- 446-1065 Phone # 415-257-8480

Price ea 
with Tax

Budget 
2002-
2003

Desc./ 
Exception Each Total

Desc./ 
Exception Each Total Desc./ Exception Each

0.00 no bid 0.00 no bid 0.00

Epson 7800 ea unit to 
include ELPLL05 middle 
throw lens (2) add'l spare 
lamps 8,245.00

3,938.22

Mitsubishi 
XL30 / 
VLTXL30LP 4,029.00 20,145.00 4,205.00 21,025.00

Mitsubishi LX300 ea unit to 
include: 2 add'l spare lamps 5,565.00

0.00 no bid 0.00 no bid 0.00
Sharp XG-P25x ea unit to 
include 2 add'l spare lamps 6,260.00

0.00 no bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 no bid

8,114.54

6079 w/o 
lamps.  Ea 
lamp $519 8,117.00 8,117.00

Does not 
include lens. 
Vendor was 
not provided a 
part number 
for the lens

non compliant  
6958  no bid



Company VMI Company PCD Company
Name Michael Mitchell Name Name
Phone # 916 369-6911 Phone # 707-546-3633 Phone #

Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each Total

41,225.00

Powerlight 
7800 / 
ELPLL05 / 
lamps 7,463.00 37,315.00 no bid 0.00

27,825.00

XL30 w/2 
VLTXL30LP 
lamps 4,489.00 22,445.00 5,950.00 29,750.00 0.00

31,300.00 no bid 0.00

Projector avail 
now, lamps 
B/O mid 
October 6,025.00 30,125.00 0.00

0.00 no bid 0.00 no bid 0.00

0.00

w. lamps and 
lens/XL5950 / 
OL-X500LZ 
lens / VLT-
XL595OL? 
lamps 8,814.00 8,814.00 no bid 0.00



Company CCS Presentation Sys Company Troxell Comm Inc Company Global Presenter Co Company
Name Ryan Law Name Bruce Williams Name Ken Peterson Name
Phone # 408-436-2224 Phone # 925 335-9408 Phone # 714 842-4310 Phone #

Desc./ 
Exception Total

Desc./ 
Exception Each Total

Desc./ 
Exception Each Total

Desc./ 
Exception

3 yr 
warranty 6,280.00 31,400.00

lens & lamp 
inc 6,575.00 32,875.00 As specified 6,877.63 34,388.15

lens & lamp 
inc

3 yr 
warranty 3,750.00 18,750.00 lamps inc 4,295.00 21,475.00 no bid 0.00 lamps inc

no bid 0.00 lamps inc 6,095.00 30,475.00 no bid 0.00 lamps inc

3 yr 
warranty/V12 
H004M01 lens 11,265.00 11,265.00 no bid 0.00 As specified 11,017.29 11,017.29

lens & lamp 
inc

3 year 
warranty OL-
X500LZ lens 
(2.4-3.3) & 
lamp & lamp 
coupon BID 
Withdrawn 
Wrong 
Amount. 0.00

W/standard 
lens plus 
OLX500LZ 
lens & 
lamp/$9025. 
W/no stand 
lens plus 
OLX500LZ 
lens & lamp 
$8605 8,605.00 8,605.00 no bid 0.00

lens & lamp 
inc



MCSI Company Spinitar Company AGS Company B & H 
Katie Benson Name Maria Alvararez Name Mike Rayburn Name
415 381-7221 Phone # 800-722-6444  ext 224 Phone # 800 363-2111 Phone # 800-947-8003

Each Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each

6,750.00 33,750.00 0.00 no bid 0.00 As specified 4,336.00

4,300.00 21,500.00 0.00

1 lamp 
w/rebate, 1 
lamp @ $379.  
$3293 w/o 
lamp 3,672.00 18,360.00 no bid

5,850.00 29,250.00 0.00
ea lamp $457.  
3540 w/o lamp 4,454.00 22,270.00 no bid

11,300.00 11,300.00 0.00 no bid 0.00 no bid

8,475.00 8,475.00 0.00

1 lamp @ 
$398, 1 lamp 
w/ rebate.  
$7168 w/o 
lamp 7,566.00 7,566.00 no bid



Company VSA Company Comp View
Name Name Cynthia Washburn
Phone # 800-888-2140 Phone # 877-297-2078

Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each Total

21,680.00 no bid 0.00
$5420 w/o lamp, 
each lamp $375 6,170.00 30,850.00

0.00 no bid 0.00

1 lamp w/ 
rebate, 1 lamp 
@ $379.  $3319 
w/o lamp 3,698.00 18,490.00

0.00 no bid 0.00 no bid 0.00

0.00 no bid 0.00

ea lamp $536.  
$9209 w/o 
lamps 10,281.00 10,281.00

0.00 no bid 0.00

1 lamp @ $401, 
1 lamp w/rebate, 
$7450 w/o lamp 7,851.00 7,851.00


