
Baker Remodel Company ATV Video Center Company Audio Graph
Non-Compliant to Specification Name Jon Bryant Name Michael Rayb

 Winning Lowest Responsive Vendor Phone # (888)973-9149 Phone # (800) 363-21

Item Desc Qt Auto Pick LOW Item Awarded to: ea line
Price ea with 
Tax Budget 2002-2003 Comments Each Total Comments Each

1 Amp, Rolls RA-235 5
130.00 Full Compass 130.00 650.00 139.43 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 187.00 935.00 No Bid

2 19" Rack Blank Panel, 1 Rack Space Color Black ,Middle 
Atlantic  BL-1

5

9.00 Full Compass 9.00 45.00 9.65 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 10.50 52.50

Est. Del. 10-15 
days. As 
Specified. 10.99

3 19" Rack Blank Panel, 2 Rack Space Color Black, Middle 
Atlantic  BL-2

5

11.00 Full Compass 11.00 55.00 11.80 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 11.90 59.50

Est. Del. 10-15 
days. As 
Specified. 12.78

4 Cart A/V, Bretford A2642E : Each cart includes: Electrical 
Unit

5

68.85 Troxell 68.85 344.25 73.84 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 98.40 492.00

Est. Del. 5-10 
days. As 
Specified. 97.00

5 Closed Caption Decoder,  Broadcast Video Systems Corp 
(BVS) cc-100 w/GPI Disable option

5
231.00 VMI Inc 231.00 1,155.00 247.75 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 259.00 1,295.00 No Bid.

6 Infrared Controller, Xantech 590-10 To include: Power 
supply 781RG

5

171.00 AGS 171.00 855.00 183.40 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 178.50 892.50

Est. Del. 3-5 
days. As 
specified. 590-
10/163.00 ea. 
781RG/8.00 ea. 171.00

7 Overhead Projector,  Elmo HP-L-2900H DX  Each to 
Include:(1) Roller attachment #4557 (1) Roll acetate Avcom 
950 50'

5

199.65 AGS 199.65 998.25 214.12 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 253.65 1,268.25

Est. Del. 5-10 
days. As 
Specified. 
HPL2900H-DX 
174.00. 
#4557/17.30 
ea. #950/8.35 
ea. 199.65

8 Power Strip Rack Mount, Tripplite IBAR12 5

79.00 CDWG 79.00 395.00 84.73 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 129.00 645.00

Est. Del. 7-15 
days. As 
specified. 120.00

9 Presentation Stand, Samsung SDP-900 # 500278   Price to 
includes 2 year Samsung Manufacturer Extended Warranty

1

2,195.00 AGS  SDP_900DX 2,195.00 2,195.00 2,354.14
Est. Del. 10-21 days.  
Not DX model 2,773.00

Est. Del. 5-10 
days. As 
specified. SDP-
900 (non 
DX/1700.00 
ea.) or SDP-900 
DX (2195.00 
ea.) 2 year 
warranty as 
specified. 2,195.00

10 Speaker, TOA H1 2

72.80 AGS 72.80 145.60 78.08 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 93.50 187.00

Est. Del. 10-14 
days. As 
specified. 72.80

11 Speaker, TOA H2 3

81.00 AGS 81.00 243.00 86.87 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 107.00 321.00

Est. Del. 10-14 
days. As 
specified. 81.00

12 VGA Splitter, Extron P/2 DA 2 PLUS     #60-046-02 5

88.79 Troxell 88.79 443.95 95.23 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 103.50 517.50

Est. Del. 3-5 
days. As 
specified. 92.00

13 VGA Switcher , Extron SW2 VGArs      #60-257-22  each to 
include rack kit 60-190-01

5

505.00 Northern Video 505.00 2,525.00 541.61 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 539.00 243.00

Est. Del. 5-10 
days. As 
specified. 60-
257-22/475.00 
ea. 60-180-
01/90.00 ea. 565.00

14 VHS Recorder, Panasonic AG-2580 5

189.00

Full Compass NOTE Cal 
Media Was Low BUT 
only by $1.00 and Full 
Compass had other 

items awarded. 190.00 950.00 203.78 Est. Del. 10-21 days. 243.00 1,215.00

Est. Del. 9-15 
days. As 
specified. 244.00

15 XGA Touch Panel, Hitachi 15" Starboard EM Panel, 
Portable, # SBEMPNL1

5

1,760.00 AGS 1,760.00 8,800.00 1,887.60
Not a dealer for 
product. No Bid. 0.00

Est. Del. 5-10 
days. As 
specified. 1,760.00



hic Systems Company AV Center Company Bradley Broadcast Company CDW Government Inc Company California Media Solutions,Company Full Compass Systems LTD Company Northern Vid
burn Name John Rodakawski Name Jerry Atlrey Name Michele Yarra Name N/A Name (?) Name N/A
11 Phone # (406) 446-1065 Phone # (800)732-7665 Phone # (877) 267-8610 Phone # (888) 881-8273 Phone # (608)831-7330 Phone # (800)366-447

Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each

0.00  165.00 825.00
Est. De. 7-10 
days. 133.00 665.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 130.00 650.00 No Bid

54.95
Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 16.00 80.00

Est. De. 7-10 
days. 12.00 60.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 9.00 45.00 Est. Del. 10 days. 12.00

63.90
Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 19.00 95.00

Est. De. 7-10 
days. 13.50 67.50 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 11.00 55.00 Est. Del. 10 days. 14.00

485.00 185.00 925.00 No Bid 0.00

Est. Del. 10 
days. Tax on 
order 67.50 180.00 750.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 10-15 
days. 145.00 725.00 Est. Del. 10 days. 127.00

0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

855.00 NO Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

998.25 255.00 1,275.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 No Bid

600.00
Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 109.00 545.00

Est. De. 7-10 
days. 122.00 610.00

Est. Del. 5 days. 
Tax on order 
29.63 79.00 395.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 91.00 455.00 No Bid

2,195.00
Est. Del. 7-10 
days.  DX Model 2,500.00 2,500.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 No Bid

145.60
Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 89.00 178.00

Est. De. 7-10 
days. 94.00 188.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 86.00 172.00 Est. Del. 20 days. 95.00

243.00
Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 99.00 297.00

Est. De. 7-10 
days. 105.00 315.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 7-10 
days. 97.00 291.00 Est. Del. 20 days. 105.00

460.00

Est. Del. 7-10 
days. P2 Da2xi 60-
506-01 130.00 650.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 10-15 
days. 109.00 545.00 Est. Del. 20 days. 103.00

2,825.00

Bid withwdrawn 
@430 missing 
assyEst. Del. 7-10 
days. 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

Est. Del. 10-15 
days. 564.00 2,820.00 Est. Del. 10 days. 505.00

1,220.00 Est.Del. 7-10 days 236.00 1,180.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 Est. Del. 5 days 189.00 945.00
Est. Del. 10-15 
days. 190.00 950.00 Est. Del. 20 days. 247.00

8,800.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid



deo Systems Company Oliver World Class Lab Company Snader & Associates Company Troxell Communications Company VMI INC Company Video Service of America
Name Randy Oliver Name Ron Kawata Name Bruce Williams Name Michael Mitchell Name Marty Shrader

72 ext.736 Phone # (800) 877-6720 Phone # (415) 257-8480 Phone # (800) 578-8858 Phone # (916) 369-6911 Phone # (800) 88-2140

Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total

0.00 No Bid 0.00 No bid 0.00 136.95 684.75
Est. Del. 1wk 
ARO 134.00 670.00 No Bid 0.00

60.00 No Bid 0.00
Est. Del. 15 
days. 9.85 49.25 10.65 53.25

Est. Del. 1wk 
ARO 11.00 55.00 No Bid 0.00

70.00 No Bid 0.00
Est. Del. 15 
days. 11.45 57.25 13.65 68.25

Est. Del. 1wk 
ARO 13.00 65.00 No Bid 0.00

635.00 No Bid 0.00
Est. Del. 30 
days. 185.00 925.00 68.85 344.25

Est. Del. 1-2wks 
ARO 180.00 900.00 141.26 706.30

0.00 No Bid 0.00
Est. Del. 30 
days. 270.00 1,350.00 No Bid 0.00

Est. Del. 1-2wks 
ARO 231.00 1,155.00 No Bid 0.00

0.00 No Bid 0.00 No bid 0.00 179.95 899.75
Est. Del. 1-2wks 
ARO 260.00 1,300.00 No Bid 0.00

0.00 No Bid 0.00

Est. Del. 30 
days. Elmo 4367 
Writing Roll 238.00 1,190.00

OHP/189.95.  
Roller/19.87.  
Roll/12.19 222.01 1,110.05

Est. Del. 1-2wks 
ARO.No on the 
Avcom 950. 
Subbed w/Elmo 
4367. 251.00 1,255.00

Est. Del. 21 
days.(? Roll will 
be VSA ?) 211.93 1,059.65

0.00 No Bid 0.00
Est. Del. 30 
days. 130.00 650.00 82.59 412.95

Est. Del. 1wk 
ARO 99.00 495.00 No Bid 0.00

0.00 No Bid 0.00

Est. Del. 30 
days. 
SDP900DX 
#700965 2,820.00 2,820.00

Samsung 
SDP900 DX 
(Replaces 
SDP900 now 
discontinued) 2,259.00 2,259.00

Est. Del. 1-2wks 
ARO. SDP900 
DX w/part 
#700965 2,667.00 2,667.00 No Bid 0.00

190.00 No Bid 0.00 No bid 0.00 76.50 153.00
Est. Del. 1-2wks 
ARO 92.00 184.00 No Bid 0.00

315.00 No Bid 0.00 No bid 0.00 84.80 254.40
Est. Del. 1-2wks 
ARO 103.00 309.00 No Bid 0.00

515.00

Est. Del 14 
days. ARO 
approx. 97.00 485.00

Est. Del. 15 
days. 110.00 550.00 88.79 443.95

Est. Del. 1wk 
ARO 109.00 545.00 99.80 499.00

2,525.00

Est. Del 14 
days. ARO 
approx. 675.00 3,375.00

Est. Del. 15 
days. 550.00 2,750.00 509.82 2,549.10

Est. Del. 1wk 
ARO 545.00 2,725.00 612.82 3,064.10

1,235.00

Est. Del 14 
days. ARO 
approx. 289.00 1,445.00

Est. Del. 30 
days. 255.00 1,275.00 196.85 984.25

Est. Del. 1-2wks 
ARO 250.00 1,250.00 195.54 977.70

0.00 No Bid 0.00
Est. Del. 30 
days. 2,235.00 11,175.00 1,819.00 9,095.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00


