Summer Equipment -
Quote Due July 28th @ 2PM PST

Company CDW-G Company
Non-Compliant to Specification Name Kevin Cooper Name
Winning Lowest Responsive Vendor Phone # 866-208-3849 Phone #

Bid or Quotation # BRSL811 Bid or Quotation #
Auto Pick
Iltem Desc Qt LOwW Item Awarded to: |ea line Price ea with Tax Comments Each Total Comments
1|Bluray player, Panasonic DMP-BD85K 1 Video Service of
206.95] America 206.95 206.95 225.42 208.99 208.99|PER SPEC
2|5ch Amplifier, Denon AVR-988P 1 Troxell
1,038.00] Communications 1,038.00 1,038.00 1,130.64 no bid 0.00
3|VGA 4 switch, Extron SW4 VGA Ars #60- 1
258-22 728.32 Sensco 728.32 728.32 793.32 no bid 0.00{NO QUOTE
4|VGA DA, EXTRON P/2 DA2 PLUS #60- 2
046-03 96.86 Sensco 96.86 193.72 105.50 no bid 0.00{NO QUOTE
5|/Combo DVD/VHS Recorder, Toshiba 1 Video Service of
DVR670KU 212.15] America 212.15 212.15 231.08 214.80 214.80
6|Rack Mount, Middle Atlantic for Toshiba 1
DVR670KU 76.81] Full Compass 76.81 76.81 83.67 99.20 99.20
7|Ip Controller, Global Cache GC-100-18 2
0.00] No Bids Received 0.00 0.00 no bid 0.00(NO QUOTE
8[Wxga Projector, Panasonic PT-FW300U 1
Price must include one replacement lamp
beyond lamp installed in projector for
each projector. price does not include
sales tax
Please note: The District requires a 5
year warranty with purchase of
projectors. If a manufacture cannot offer
5 year warranty, indicate what the
warranty period is for the projector and
include the additional cost for a third party
warranty for the remaining warranty
period in the unit price. Bidder must
provide a copy of the actual warranty for
review plus any third party warranties if
applicable. Quality of the warranty
coverage will be taken into consideration
Troxell
2,130.00] Communications 2,130.00 2,130.00 2,320.10 no bid 0.00
9|Talkback Mic, Shure MX418/S 1 146.31 Full Compass 146.31 146.31 159.37 245.00 245.00
10{Document Camera, ElImo TT-02RX 1 Video Service of
524.36 America 524.36 524.36 571.16 545.00 545.00
11|Anti-Theft Bracket, ElImo #9416-1 1 Video Service of
59.95] America 59.95 59.95 65.30 71.00 71.00
636.46 1,383.99




Oliver

TROXELL COMMUNICATION{Company Worldclass Labs Company VSA, INC Company Sesco Data Company Full Compass
LANNY MARTY
RUTKIN Name David Barber Name SHRADER Name Mike Hussey Name Eric Radej
800-888-
707-642-0166 Phone # 415-419-5559 Phone # 2140 Phone # 916.641.2244 Phone # 800.356.5844
Bid or
Bid or Quotation # |DB0710-7 Quotation # BID PRICE Santa Ros 696549
Desc./ Desc./
Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Exception Each Total Exception Each
225.00 225.00 0.00 206.95 206.95 259.12 259.12 214.50
1,038.00 1,038.00 0.00|no bid 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00(no bid 0.00 728.32 728.32
0.00 0.00|no bid 0.00 96.86 193.72
235.00 235.00 0.00| DVR670 212.15 212.15 0.00
148.00 148.00 0.00|no bid 0.00 0.00 76.81
0.00 0.00(no bid 0.00 0.00
2,130.00 2,130.00 0.00|no bid 0.00 0.00 2,462.38
164.00 164.00 0.00 166.20 166.20 199.04 199.04 146.31
537.00 537.00 1.00 629.00 629.00 524.36 524.36 0.00 598.29
71.00 71.00 1.00 65.00 65.00 59.95 59.95 0.00
4,548.00 694.00 1,169.61 1,380.20



B&H Photo

Company Video
Name Michel Friedman
Phone # 800.947.8003
305580510
Desc./
Total Exception Each Total
214.50 215.00 215.00
0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00
0.00 229.00 229.00
76.81 0.00
0.00 0.00
2,462.38 2,199.00 2,199.00
146.31 179.00 179.00
598.29 599.00 599.00
0.00 65.00 65.00
3,498.29 3,486.00




