
Media Equipment - Digital Signage 2010 Company IVCi
Quote Due March 4th @2PM Non-Compliant to Specification Name Felipe Hena

 Winning Lowest Responsive Vendor Phone # 408-824-08
Bid or Quotation # 022310IVC

Item Desc
Quote 

Qt
Purch 

QT Auto Pick LOW
Item to be 

Awarded to: ea line
Line Cost with 

9.25%
Price ea 
with Tax Comments Each

1 40 inch Digital Display, NEC Model ASPV40-AVT 1 0

5,825.00 Not Awarded 0.00 0.00 0.00

NO TUNER IN MODEL 
This specific unit has 
been discontinued 
closest match is the 
NEC LCD4215 
@$1094.5

2 * 40 inch Digital Display, Samsung Model 400CX-2 1 0 949.00 Not Awarded 949.00 0.00 0.00 1,036.78 2,211.00
3 * 42 inch Digital Display, LG Electronics Model M4213CCBA 1 0 961.00 Not Awarded 961.00 0.00 0.00 1,049.89

4 32 inch Digital Display, NEC Model LCD 3215 9 0

579.00 Not Awarded 536.00 0.00 0.00 585.58 605.00
5 * 32 inch Digital Display, Samsung Model 320MP-2 9 0 595.00 Not Awarded 595.00 0.00 0.00 650.04  Samsung 320MP-2 621.50
6 * 32 inch Digital Display, LG Electronics Model M3203-CBA 9 2 562.00 CDW-G 562.00 1,124.00 1,227.97 613.99
7 * 40 inch Digital Display, NEC Model P401-AV 8 0g p y,

1,372.80 Not Awarded 1,267.00 0.00 0.00 1,384.20 NEC P401 1,372.80
8 * 40 inch Digital Display, Samsung Model 400UX-2 8 0

1,237.00 Not Awarded 1,237.00 0.00 0.00 1,351.42 2,910.60
9 * 42 inch Digital Display, LG Electronics Model M4224CCBA 8 8

1,210.00 CDW-G 1,210.00 9,680.00 10,575.40 1,321.93
10 * 46 inch Digital Display, NEC Model P461-AV 6 0

1,820.50 Not Awarded 1,625.00 0.00 0.00 1,775.31  NEC P461 1,820.50
11 * 46 inch Digital Display, Samsung Model 460UX-2 6 0 1,672.20 Not Awarded 1,672.20 0.00 0.00 1,826.88 2,211.00
12 * 47 inch Digital Display, LG Electronics Model M4715CCBA 6 5 1,334.53 CDW-G 1,334.53 6,672.65 7,289.87 1,457.97
13 * 52 inch Digital Display, NEC Model LCD5220-AV OR P521-AV 1 0

2,409.36 Not Awarded 2,339.00 0.00 0.00 2,555.36 2,964.50
14 52 inch Digital Display, Samsung Model 520DX 1 0

2,207.00

This would be 
only NON LG 

product  to be low 
going with all LG 2,207.23 0.00 0.00 2,411.40 2,513.50

15 * 52 inch Digital Display, LG Electronics Model M5201C-BA 1 1 2,369.00 CDW-G 2,369.00 2,369.00 2,588.13 2,588.13
16 21 681 3716 21,681.37



Company Troxell Communications Company CCS Presentation Systems, Company CDW-G Company VSA Company CMS Creative Solutions
ao Name David Woolson Name Ryan Law Name Kevin Cooper Name Marty Shrader Name
805 Phone # 800.352.7912 ext. 1750 Phone # 408-545-0555 x14 Phone # 312-705-3391 Phone # 8000-888-2140 Phone # 916 408-6880
Ci Bid or Quotation # Quote #Q175011208 Bid or Quotation # Bid or Quotation # TFD3488, TCV1457, and BNCB020 Bid or Quotation #

Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total

0.00 NO BID 0.00 not bidding 0.00

NO TUNER IN MODEL 
Disco'd, using P401-AV 
@1267 0.00 NO Bid 0.00

NO TUNER IN 
MODEL P401-
AV @$1745 0.00

2,211.00 1,099.00 1,099.00 975.00 975.00 949.00 949.00 400CX-2 1,146.62 1,146.62 0.00
0.00 1,144.00 1,144.00 1,015.00 1,015.00 961.00 961.00 M4213CCBA 1,047.41 1,047.41 0.00

5,445.00 649.00 5,841.00 not bidding 0.00

Price Withdrawn for 
Quanity reduction 
@$595 0.00 LCD 3215 592.18 5,329.62 LCD 3215 749.00 6,741.00

5,593.50 694.00 6,246.00 615.00 5,535.00 595.00 5,355.00 320MP-2 709.34 6,384.06 0.00

0.00 659.00 5,931.00 595.00 5,355.00 562.00 5,058.00  M3203C-BA 622.34 5,601.06 0.00
Price Withdrawn for 

10,982.40 1,449.00 11,592.00 not bidding 0.00
Quanity reduction 
@$1267 0.00 P401-AVT 1,486.67 11,893.36  P401-AV 1,469.00 11,752.00

23,284.80
bidding 

400uxnud2 1,989.00 15,912.00 1,397.00 11,176.00 1,237.00 9,896.00 400UX-2 1,449.32 11,594.56 0.00

0.00 1,349.00 10,792.00
  part should read 
M4224C-BA 1,245.00 9,960.00

Price As Specified, alt unit 
offered M4213CCBA 
@$961 1,210.00 9,680.00 M4224CCBA 1,304.60 10,436.80 0.00

10,923.00 NO BID 0.00 not bidding 0.00

Price Withdrawn for 
Quanity reduction 
@$1625 0.00  P461-AVT 1,878.32 11,269.92 P461-AV 1,899.00 11,394.00

13,266.00 NO BID 0.00 1,742.00 10,452.00 1,672.20 10,033.20 460UX-2 1,940.29 11,641.74 0.00
0.00 1,449.00 8,694.00 1,369.00 8,214.00 1,334.53 8,007.18  M4715CCBA 1,435.64 8,613.84 0.00

2,964.50 LCD5220AV 2,549.00 2,549.00 not bidding 0.00

Price Withdrawn for 
Quanity reduction 
@$2339 0.00 LCD5220-AV 2,409.36 2,409.36 LCD5220-AV 2,695.00 2,695.00

2,513.50 2,465.00 2,465.00 2,315.00 2,315.00 2,207.00 2,207.00  520DX 2,592.61 2,592.61 0.00
0.00 2,499.00 2,499.00 2,399.00 2,399.00 2,369.00 2,369.00 M5201C-BA 0.00 0.00

77 183 70 74 764 00 57 396 00 54 515 38 89 960 96 BID ALL NONE 32 582 0077,183.70 74,764.00 57,396.00 54,515.38 89,960.96 BID ALL or NONE 32,582.00



Company B&H Photo
Name Michel Friedman
Phone # 800 947-8003

Bid or Quotation # 290343920

Comments Each Total

PV40AVTL 5,825.00 5,825.00
CXN-2 1,410.00 1,410.00

1,199.00 1,199.00

579.00 5,211.00
599.00 5,391.00

699.00 6,291.00

AVT 1,474.00 11,792.00

1,299.00 10,392.00

1,399.00 11,192.00

AVT 1,924.00 11,544.00
1,699.00 10,194.00
1,520.00 9,120.00

5220AV 2,974.00 2,974.00

2,299.00 2,299.00
2,599.00 2,599.00

97 433 0097,433.00


