Media Equipment - April 2009

Company B&H Photo Company Roscor Company CDW-G Company Full Compass Company Video Service of America Company Troxell Comm
Quote Due April 27 Non-Compliant to Name Fred| Name Bruce Berg Name Kevin Cooper Name Eric Radej | Name Marty S Name Bruce Williams
Winning Lowest Ri Vendor Phone # 800.221.5743 Phone # 847-299-8080 Phone # 312-705-3391 Phone # 800.356.5844. Phone # 800.888.2140 Phone # 800 578-5585
#258483950 BB04-22-09 Quote# MR93146 510941
Price ea with Desc./ Desc./ Desc./
Item Desc Qt Item Awarded to:  |ea line Tax Desc./ Exception Each Total Desc./ Exception Each Total Desc./ Exception Each Total Exception Each Total Exception Each Total Exception Each Total
1| HD Camcorder, Canon #VIXIA HF20 4
,ejigl;‘, (DIENGT: SR CIE CEubEe: 740.00 Troxell 740.00) 2,960.00) 808.45] 898.00 3,592.00 827.75 3,311.00 845.99 3,383.96 804.38 3,217.52 769.69 3,078.76 740.00 2,960.00
2| HD SDHC Memory Card, SANDISK 4
8GB Class 4 Speed # SDSDHV-008GR 33.00 B&H 33.00 132.00) 36.05) 33.00 132.00(no bid 0.00] 35.00 140.00 46.51 186.04 37.62 150.48 45.00 180.00
3| SD/SDHC/microSD High Speed USB 2.0 4
Card Reader/Writer, Panasonic # BN-
SDUSB3U 28.00) B&H 28.00) 112.00 30.59) 28.00; 112.00 36.95, 147.80|no bid 0.00 30.00; 120.00 31.14 124.56 28.75 115.00
4] Lightweight Camcorder Tripod, 4 |§ogen Aiptek ZAC-STD-5 Smith Victor Velbon CX
32.16 VSA 32.16| 128.64] 35.13| Bogen 785SHB 59.00 236.00{701HDV,190XV 215.00 860.00|@14.75 0.00 0.00|P900 32.16 128.64(444 35.00 140.00
5| Suspended ceiling adapter, Chief 2
CMS440 68.50 Troxell 68.50) 137.00) 74.84] 79.00 158.00 81.15) 162.30 80.00 160.00 76.04 152.08 68.72 137.44 68.50 137.00
6| LCD monitor ceiling mount, Chief FHP18-| 2
110 111.18 VSA 111.18] 222.36) 121.46 144.00 288.00 136.00 272.00 148.99 297.98 118.50 237.00 111.18 222.36 112.60 225.20
7| Camera ceiling mount, Sony EVI CM- 2 fICP-ITV-D30/EVI-
100B 36 in 88.00] 0.00 0.00] D30A 88.00 176.00(no bid 0.00no bid 0.00 0.00{N/B 0.00] 0.00]
8[ Camera ceiling mount, Sony EVI CM- 2
100B 42 in 0.00] Not awardec 0.00, 0.00] N/B no bid 0.00|no bid 0.00 0.00|N/B 0.00! 0.00!
9| Solid-State Audio Relay, RDL Labs Stick 2
on # ST-SSR1 80.69 Full Compass 80.69) 161.38] 88.15] 99.00 198.00(no bid 0.00no bid 0.00 80.69 161.38 88.21 176.42 82.35 164.70
10| Accessory Mounting System, RDL Labs # 1 AMS-UF1
AMS SYSTEM 22.34) Not awarded 22.34] 22.34] 24.41 30.00 30.00{no bid 0.00|no bid 0.00|??2? 22.34 22.34|N/B 0.00] 0.00]
11| Digitally Controlled Attenuator, RDL Labs| 1
# RU-VCA2D 240.00 Not awarded 240.00) 240.00) 262.20) 279.00 279.00(no bid 0.00(no bid 0.00 240.63 240.63 263.67 263.67 240.00 240.00
12|USB G5 Keyboard, Logic Keyboard Pro 1
Tools # LKBU-PT-APG5-US 129.00] B&H 0.00, 0.00] 129.00 129.00(no bid 0.00|no bid 0.00 0.00|N/B 0.00] 0.00]
13| Camcorder Audio Adapter Dual XLR 2
Connections, Beachtek DXA-6A 239.15) VSA 2,393.15 4,786.30| 2,614.52] 259.00 518.00 260.82 521.64(no bid 0.00 266.80 533.60 239.15 478.30 251.50 503.00
14| 32in. LCD TV, LG #32LG40 1 SUB Sharp
679.00 Troxell 679.00) 679.00) 741.81) LC32DV24U $659 0.00|no bid 0.00] 735.00 735.00 0.00{N/B 0.00] 679.00 679.00
15|Wide Angle Converter Lens, Canon WD- 1
H43 43mm 0.7x 149.00] B&H 149.00) 149.00) 162.78] 149.00 149.00 166.00 166.00 165.00 165.00 164.84 164.84 150.53 150.53 159.50 159.50
16|Headphones, Sony MDR-V600 4 67.14] VSA 67.14] 268.56) 73.35) 69.00 276.00 73.75) 295.00 74.00 296.00 74.74] 298.96 67.14 268.56 69.50 278.00




