
Protools Company Cutting Edge Aud

001/06/2009 Non-Compliant to Specification Name Jeff Briss
 Winning Lowest Responsive Vendor Phone # 415 487 2323

Quote-2008-12-Pr

Item Desc Qt
Auto Pick 

LOW Item Awarded to: ea line Price with Tax Desc./ Exception Each
1 Custom C|24 HD Bundle w/ 192 IO + A|D 

card per Kerry Rose
1

19,425.00 Cutting Edge 19,425.00 19,425.00 21,076.13 19,425.00
2 Pro tools custom keyboard 1 110.00 Guitar Center 110.00 110.00 119.35 115.00
3 Sterling Modular Conversion "B" C24 desk w 1 2,715.00 Guitar Center 2,715.00 2,715.00 2,945.78 Drop ship 3,375.003 Sterling Modular Conversion B  C24 desk w 1 2,715.00 G C 2,715.00 2,715.00 2,945.78 Drop ship 3,375.00

4 Sterling Modular Articulating LCD arm 
option

1
197.00 Guitar Center 197.00 197.00 213.75 Drop ship 215.00

5 Sterling Modular Speaker Platform option 
7x 14 (pair)

1
113.00 Guitar Center 113.00 113.00 122.61 Drop ship 130.00

6 M Box 2 Educational package 10
287.00 Guitar Center 287.00 2,870.00 3,113.95

Priced as each in 
10 pack 308.00

7 Mackie HR mk2 Monitors 2 467.00 Guitar Center 467.00 934.00 1,013.39 b/o'd until 3/09 580.00
8 Shure SM57 2 73.00 Full Compass 73.00 146.00 158.41 85.00
9 AKG C3000B 1 287.00 Guitar Center 287.00 287.00 311.40 365.00

10 AKG 214 1 328.00 Guitar Center 328.00 328.00 355.88 435.00
Total 29,430.63



dio Group Company Full Compass Company Bananas at Large Company GUITAR CENTER

Name Eric Radej Name Alan Rosen Name VINCE BEDFORD
Phone # 800.356.5844 Phone # 415 457-7600 Phone # 4156900968

rotools-Quotation 461207 Prop# FX124809

Total Desc./ Exception Each Total Desc./ Exception Each Total
Desc./ 

Exception Each Total

19,425.00
out of territory-No 
Bid 0.00 19,750.00 19,750.00 20,350.00 20,350.00

115.00 Mac-version 111.10 111.10 118.82 118.82 110.00 110.00
3,375.00 No Bid 0.00 3,435.00 3,435.00 2,715.00 2,715.003,375.00 No Bid 0.00 3,435.00 3,435.00 2,715.00 2,715.00

215.00 No Bid 0.00 219.00 219.00 197.00 197.00

130.00 No Bid 0.00 129.38 129.38 113.00 113.00

3,080.00 349.00 3,490.00 300.00 3,000.00 287.00 2,870.00

1,160.00 HR824-MKII 503.14 1,006.28 HR824 559.98 1,119.96 467.00 934.00
170.00 73.00 146.00 85.00 170.00 79.00 158.00
365.00 296.57 296.57 390.95 390.95 287.00 287.00
435.00 355.88 355.88 469.50 469.50 328.00 328.00

28,470.00 5,405.83 28,802.61 28,062.00


