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Item Desc Qt
Auto Pick 

LOW Comment Item Awarded to: ea line Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments

1 Canon digital camera /w lens, Canon 
EOS Rebel XSi EF-S 18-55IS Kit

1
639.95 Not Issued 639.95 639.95 745.11 745.11 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 730.99 730.99 0.00 No Bid

2 Digital still camera, Nikon D-90 Kit 
includes Body & 18-105mm lens

1
1,148.95 B&H 1,148.95 1,148.95 no bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 1,242.00 1,242.00 0.00 No Bid

3 Digital Document Camera ,Elmo HV-
5100XG  Each to INCLUDE: Elmo 
Security Bracket #9330-01

7

2,031.72 VSA 2,031.72 14,222.04 2,331.27 16,318.89
HV5100XG, 
9330-1 2,210.00 15,470.00 NO BID 0.00 2,134.00 14,938.00 0.00

4 Voice-Activated Hand-Held Digital 
Recorder, Sanyo ICR-S700RM

1
75.50 Troxell 75.50 75.50 no bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid

5 Overhead Projectors, 3M #1780 part#78-
9236-68541 Each to include: Acetate 
Roll Avcom 950 50' and Roller 
Attachment HA5772

6

148.71 VSA 148.71 892.26 no bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid

6 AV Carts, Bretford A-2642E 5 89.00 Troxell 89.00 445.00 174.93 874.65 234.00 1,170.00 NO BID 0.00 196.59 982.95 0.00 No Bid

7 PA System, Anchor Xtreme XTR-6000U 
options: 2 wireless Mics, XTR-6001 (2) 
Ext. speakers, (2) Heavy-duty Speaker 
stands, NL-6000 Storage cover

1

2,185.00 Roscor 2,185.00 2,185.00

Spec per items 
as described in 
Email update 
11-19 revB 2,455.20 2,455.20

XBP-6000 
DUAL Xtreme 
Basic 
Package(2) 
NL6000 2,185.00 2,185.00 per 11/19/08 update. 3,214.28 3,214.28 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid

8 PA System, Anchor FL-4500 Admiral 
OPTIONS LC-400 Slipcover /ADD 
second Isolated Microphone XLR

1

1,259.00 Troxell 1,259.00 1,259.00 1,305.85 1,305.85 No Bid 0.00

(1) FL-6000 Admiral 
(replaces FL-4500), (1) LC-
400 cover, (1) ASM add't xlr 
shock mount 1,603.12 1,603.12 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid

9 PA System, Anchor  LITE-DP DELUXE 
PACKAGE: MiniVox Lite (PB-30U1) with 
soft case, wired mic, Battery 
Recharge Kit and transmitter WB-6000 
body pack ,EM-60T UltraLite 
microphone

1

575.00 Troxell 575.00 575.00 649.67 649.67

PB-30U1, RC-
30, WB-6000, 
EM60T 670.00 670.00 LITE-DP DELUXE 792.64 792.64 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid

10 PA System, Anchor  MINIVOX 
PACKAGE - (MINI-BP) PB-25U1 with 
wireless receiver, WB-6000 body pack 
LM-60 lapel  microphone: and CC-25 
carrying bag

1

497.00 Troxell 497.00 497.00

Superceded by 
LITE-DP 
(PB30U1) 649.67 649.67 No Bid 0.00

MINI-BP - IS BEING 
DISCONTINUED, 
AVAILABLE WHILE 
QUANTITIES LAST 624.64 624.64 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid

11 Multimeter, Fluke 289 1 460.00 CDW-G 460.00 460.00 no bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 460.00 460.00 464.15 464.15 No Bid

12 Easel Double Sided, Quartet Unimate 
Total Erasel , Adjustable Height, Black 
Frame #100TE EACH to INCLUDE 
CARRYING CASE #100EC

5

409.98 CDW-G 409.98 2,049.90 no bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 409.98 2,049.90 0.00 No Bid

13 AMP, ALESIS RA-150 1 146.51 Bradley 146.51 146.51 147.08 147.08 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid

14 Rack Drawer,  Middle Atlantic TD-2 1 83.46 Full Compass 83.46 83.46 83.46 83.46 0.00 NO BID 0.00 87.99 87.99 105.58 105.58 No Bid

15 Rack Power Stip,Triplite  
ISOBAR12ULTRA

1
86.00 CDW-G 86.00 86.00 95.20 95.20 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 86.00 86.00 100.11 100.11 No Bid

16 VGA Switcher, Extron SW4 VGA Ars 
#60-258-22 each to include-Rack Kit  
#60-190-01

1

508.00 Roscor 508.00 508.00 no bid 0.00
60-258-22, 60-
190-01 508.00 508.00 NO BID 0.00 698.98 698.98 0.00 No Bid

17 VGA DA, Extron P/2 DA2 PLUS             
#60-046-03 

1
108.00 CompView 108.00 108.00 no bid 0.00 114.00 114.00 NO BID 0.00 134.00 134.00 0.00 No Bid

18 Closed Caption Decoder, BVS CC-100 
with GPI option

1
241.00 Roscor 241.00 241.00 no bid 0.00 241.00 241.00 NO BID 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid

19 15” Touch monitor, HITACHI T-15XL 1

1,309.00 Troxell 1,309.00 1,309.00 no bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00

The 15" is 
discontinued, 
only the 17" is 
available. Does 
not include 8.00 
Recyling fee 1,625.00 1,625.00 0.00 No Bid

20 DVD/VHS Recorders- JVC DRMV-100B 1
194.95 B&H 194.95 194.95 220.23 220.23 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 220.00 220.00 0.00 No Bid

21 Equipment Rack Shelf, Middle-Atlantic 
RSH-4A for JVC DRMV-100B

1
80.30 Full Compass 80.30 80.30 80.30 80.30 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 87.00 87.00 102.16 102.16 No Bid

22 RS-232/IR controller, Global Caché GC-
100-12

1
265.00 CompView 265.00 265.00 no bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 No Bid



CCS Presentation Systems Company B&H Company Troxell Comm Company Bradley-Matthews, LLC Company CompView Company Video Service Of America

Ryan Law Name Name Bruce Williams Name Jerry Athey Name Cynthia Washburn Carolyn Name Marty Shrader

4085450555x11 Phone # Phone # 925.335.9408 Phone # 800-732-7665 Phone # 877-297-2078 Phone # 800-888-2140

80858 B#24484367 BH#244367850 Q#43045238 Quote # 114499 Quote # bowden11-25-08

Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total

0.00 639.95 639.95 745.00 745.00 No Bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 716.09 716.09

0.00 1,148.95 1,148.95 1,269.00 1,269.00 No Bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 1,233.81 1,233.81

2,167.00 15,169.00 0.00 2,085.00 14,595.00 No Bid 0.00 2,100.00 14,700.00 2,031.72 14,222.04

0.00 0.00
Sanyo ICR-

S250RM 75.50 75.50 No Bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 N/B 0.00

0.00 151.00 906.00 159.50 957.00 No Bid 0.00 175.00 1,050.00 148.71 892.26
0.00 0.00 89.00 445.00 No Bid 0.00 198.00 990.00 179.34 896.70

0.00 3,699.00 3,699.00 2,445.00 2,445.00

Spec per 
items as 

described 
Email 

update11-
19revB 2,585.00 2,585.00

6000Dual 
“Package” to 

include (2) 
optional NL-
6000 Nylon 
Slip Covers 2,410.00 2,410.00 2,507.81 2,507.81

0.00 0.00

FL-6000 with 
cover and 2nd 
jack 1,259.00 1,259.00 No Bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 N/B 0.00

0.00 0.00 575.00 575.00 698.00 698.00 670.00 670.00 617.34 617.34

0.00 0.00 497.00 497.00 549.00 549.00 no bid 0.00
Same with LM-
60 617.34 617.34

0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 N/B 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 N/B 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 146.51 146.51 199.00 199.00 153.62 153.62
0.00 0.00 112.00 112.00 88.15 88.15 95.00 95.00 107.21 107.21

0.00 0.00 105.00 105.00 149.00 149.00 110.00 110.00 107.34 107.34

0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid 0.00 520.00 520.00 N/B 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid 0.00 108.00 108.00 N/B 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00
BVS-

CC100GPI 265.00 265.00 no bid 0.00 249.34 249.34

0.00 1,650.00 1,650.00 T-17XSL 1,309.00 1,309.00 No Bid 0.00 no bid 0.00 N/B 0.00

0.00 194.95 194.95 199.00 199.00 248.00 248.00 240.00 240.00 209.52 209.52

0.00 0.00 101.50 101.50 98.00 98.00 88.00 88.00 108.36 108.36

0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid 0.00 265.00 265.00 N/B 0.00


