
Media Equipment 2008-07
Company Full Compass Company CDW-G Company SOUND EXPRESSIONS Company Bradley-Matthews, LLC Company

SESCO 
Wholesale

DUE--Tuesday August 5th @ 2PM Non-
Compliant to 
Specification Name Eric Radej Name Kevin Cooper Name A. NAKAMURA Name Jerry Athey Name Mike Hussey

 Winning 
Lowest 
Responsive 
Vendor Phone # 800.356.5844 Phone # 866-208-3849 Phone # 707-528-3565 Phone # 800-732-7665 Phone # 916.641.2244

409614 LKJ0138 11330 113366 080808MH

Item Desc Qt
Auto Pick 

LOW Item Awarded to: ea line Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each

1 DVI EDID EMULATOR, Kramer VA-1DVI 2 120.86 Full Compass 120.86 241.72 120.86 241.72 0.00 147.52 295.04 141.00 282.00
2 Camcorder, Flip Ultra 2 136.25 CDW-G 136.25 272.50 0.00 which color? 136.25 272.50 0.00 NO BID 0.00
3 Roll wire, Extron Plenum 500' (150 m) spool MHR-

5STP 2P/500 #22 181 02
1

527 00 CCS P t ti 527 00 527 00 0 00 0 00 0 00 NO BID 0 005STP-2P/500 #22-181-02 527.00 CCS Presentations 527.00 527.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00
4 Digital DVD recorder, Phillips DVDR3575H/37 * 

Replaced by-DVDR3576H/37
1

304.00

CDW-G * B&H LOW 
on only one Item 

CDW-G had others 304.00 304.00 0.00
replaced by 
DVDR3576H/37 309.99 309.99 0.00 NO BID 0.00

5 Speaker Phone Singleline, Polycom  SoundStation2 
conference phone, non-expandable, w/display #2200-
15100-001

2

309.99 CDW-G 309.99 619.98 0.00 Polycom 309.99 619.98 0.00 NO BID 0.00
6 VHS/DVD combo with 19-20” screen TV 1

192.51 Not Issued 0.00 0.00

Coby TV-
DVD2090 – 20” 
CRT TV 192.51 192.51 0.00 NO BID 0.00

7 Audience Response system, 32 remote clickers and (1) 
receiver (1) carrying case--Einstruction CPS RF 

1
2,254.00 CCS Presentations 2,254.00 2,254.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00

8 Audience Response system, 32 remote clickers and (1) 
receiver (1) carrying case--Interwrite PRS RF 

1
1,659.00 CCS Presentations 1,659.00 1,659.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00

9 AV SM Multimode – Fiber Transmitter, Extron FOX 2G 
Tx #60-941-12  

2
905.00 CompView 905.00 1,810.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00

10 AV SM Multimode – Fiber Receiver, Extron FOX 2G Rx 
#60-941-22

2
905.00 CompView 905.00 1,810.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00

11 9.5" deep rack shelf, Extron RSU 129, #60-190 2 70.00 CCS Presentations 70.00 140.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00
12 Transmitter/Reciever, Samson AH1Transmitter with 

QV10E mic and CR77 Receiver
1

211.67 Full Compass 211.67 211.67 211.67 211.67 0.00 0.00

SAMSON SWQTCV10 
& SW77R00 / ALL OR 
NOTHING ON 
SAMSON PRODUCTS 304.00 304.00

13 Rack Mount, Samson SWR55 1

19.60 Full Compass 19.60 19.60 19.60 19.60 0.00 0.00
ALL OR NOTHING ON 
SAMSON PRODUCTS 22.75 22.75

14 Power Supply, Samson SWA500 1

9.52 Full Compass 9.52 9.52 9.52 9.52 0.00 0.00
ALL OR NOTHING ON 
SAMSON PRODUCTS 11.00 11.00

15 CD Player, Tascam CD01U 1 387.00 CCS Presentations 387.00 387.00 391.10 391.10 0.00 408.00 408.00 404.00 404.00
16 Mixer, Rane MLM103 1 658.00 Full Compass 658.00 658.00 658.00 658.00 0.00 752.00 752.00 667.00 667.00
17 Equalizer, Rane DEQ60 1 626.42 Full Compass 626.42 626.42 626.42 626.42 0.00 725.56 725.56 635.00 635.00
18 Amp, QSC PLX-1804 1 529.00 Bradley 529.00 529.00 556.42 556.42 0.00 624.80 624.80 529.00 529.00
19 Speaker, Technomad Berlin 2 1,184.75 Full Compass 1,184.75 2,369.50 1,184.75 2,369.50 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00
20 Power Sequencer,Furman PS-8R 1 135.58 Full Compass 135.58 135.58 135.58 135.58 0.00 187.44 187.44 158.00 158.00
21 Rack, Middle Atlantic DWR-24-17 1 ALL OR NOTHING ON 

MIDDLE ATLANTIC 
PRODUCTS.  DWR-

397.33 Full Compass 397.33 397.33 397.33 397.33 0.00 0.00

PRODUCTS.  DWR
24-17 is a Wall Mount 
Rack, not a drawer. 487.00 487.00 509.46

22 Solid Doors, Middle Atlantic FD-12  One door lock to be 
keyed to B644; the other 420A

2

64.92 Full Compass 64.92 129.84 64.92 129.84 89.00 178.00 0.00

ALL OR NOTHING ON 
MIDDLE ATLANTIC 
PRODUCTS. Quoted 
items: SSDR-12 & 
KYLK (FD-12 will not 
work with DWR-24-17 
Wall Rack) 94.52 189.04

Price includes 
Lock Mod to 
one door 109.06

23 Vent Panel, Middle Atlantic 1 spc 1

7.69 Full Compass 7.69 7.69 7.69 7.69 10.99 10.99 0.00

ALL OR NOTHING ON 
MIDDLE ATLANTIC 
PRODUCTS 9.50 9.50

24 Blank Panel, Middle Atlantic EB-1 2

4.82 Full Compass 4.82 9.64 4.82 9.64 6.89 13.78 0.00

ALL OR NOTHING ON 
MIDDLE ATLANTIC 
PRODUCTS 6.00 12.00 7.55

25 Blank Panel, Middle Atlantic EB-2 2

6.46 Full Compass 6.46 12.92 6.46 12.92 9.79 19.58 0.00

ALL OR NOTHING ON 
MIDDLE ATLANTIC 
PRODUCTS 8.00 16.00 10.48

26 Box Shelf 3 spc, Middle Atlantic LBX-3 2

52 15 F ll C 52 15 104 30 52 15 104 30 58 00 116 00 0 00

ALL OR NOTHING ON 
MIDDLE ATLANTIC 
PRODUCTS 65 00 130 00 69 65



Company B&H Photo Company CompView Company

CCS 
Presentatio
ns Company

Interwrite 
Learning

Name L8 Name
Cynthia 
Washburn Name Ryan Law Name John Burgess

Phone # 212.239.7500 Phone # 877.297.2078 Phone #
408.545.055
5 Phone # 561 889-6585

235589300
bowden-8-12-
08

Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total
0.00 124.00 248.00 0.00 130.00 260.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

0 00 0 00 812 50 812 50 527 00 527 00 0 000.00 0.00 812.50 812.50 527.00 527.00 0.00

0.00 D VDR3576H 304.00 304.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 322.00 644.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00
Extra Pad @ 

$74.00 2,254.00 2,254.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00
Extra Clickers 

@49 1,659.00 1,659.00 1,823.00 1,823.00

0.00 0.00 905.00 1,810.00 1,026.00 2,052.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 905.00 1,810.00 1,026.00 2,052.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 74.00 148.00 70.00 140.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 444.00 444.00 0.00 387.00 387.00 0.00
0.00 709.00 709.00 0.00 720.00 720.00 0.00
0.00 674.00 674.00 0.00 686.00 686.00 0.00
0.00 644.00 644.00 0.00 550.00 550.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 159.00 159.00 0.00 145.00 145.00 0.00

509.46 0.00 427.00 427.00 560.00 560.00 0.00

218.12 0.00 0.00 82.00 164.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 13.00 13.00 0.00

15.10 0.00 5.25 10.50 10.00 20.00 0.00

20.96 0.00 6.95 13.90 12.00 24.00 0.00

139 30 0 00 62 00 124 00 67 00 134 00 0 00


