Shone Farm Media Equipment -March 2008

Company Anderson AV- East Bay|Company AV Center
Quote Due April 2, 2008 Non-Compliant to Specification Name Jeff McDonald Name Kim Rodakc
Winning Lowest Responsive Vendor Phone # 925-699-7537 Phone # 406.446.10¢€
EB8XXX
Auto Pick Price ea
Item Desc Qt LOW Comment Item Awarded to: |ea line with Tax Comments Each Total Comments Each
1 Presentation Speaker amps, Alesis, 3
RA-150 145.60) PCD 145.60 436.80 156.16 206.61 619.83
2 horns , Atlas , APX40TN 2 52.62 Full Compass 52.62 105.24 56.43 68.48 136.96
3 set of volume control plate, Atlas , 1
14.76 Full Compass 14.76 14.76 15.83 0.00:
4 Set of volume controls, Atlas 1
AT10-RM (Qty 1)
AT35-RM (Qty 1)
AT100-RM (Qty 2) 40.15 Full Compass 40.15 40.15 43.06 67.23 67.23
5 surface mount speakers , BOSE 4
M16 white ( Bose part # 040152)
60.44 Full Compass 60.44 241.76 64.82 67.38 269.52
6 projector mounts, Chief, RPAU 2 123.00) CompView 123.00 246.00 131.92 146.01 292.02 130.00
7 Control system CPU, Crestron, AV2 1 1,421.00 CCS Presentation 1,421.00 1,421.00| 1,524.02 1,650.90| 1,650.90
8 remote keypad, Crestron, C2N- 5
DB12B 136.00) CCS Presentation 136.00 680.00 145.86 158.98 794.90
9 multi interface block, Crestron, C2n- 1
Hblock 157.00 CCS Presentation 157.00 157.00 168.38 183.43 183.43
10 rack kit, Crestron, C2n-Rmak 1 78.00 CCS Presentation 78.00 78.00 83.66 91.72 91.72
11 power supply, Crestron, C2n- 1
SPWS300 789.00) CCS Presentation 789.00 789.00 846.20 917.17 917.17
12 power supply for 8 x 8, Crestron, CN- 1
PWS-75 236.00) CCS Presentation 236.00 236.00 253.11 275.15 275.15
13 rack kit , Crestron, CNXRMAK 1 79.00 CCS Presentation 79.00 79.00 84.73 91.72 91.72
14 Cresscat wire 500 ft spool, Crestron, 6
Cresscat QM-NP-SP500 252.00) PCD 252.00 1,512.00 270.27 305.72| 1,834.32
15 engraving, Crestron, DB12-BTNB 5 5.60) PCD 5.60 28.00 6.01 6.11 30.55
16 quick media receiver mounting kits, 5
Crestron, MK-QM-RMCRX 52.00 CCS Presentation 52.00 260.00 55.77 61.14 305.70
17 Cressnet wire Roll, Crestron, NP-TL- 6
SP-1000 260.00] Troxell 260.00 1,560.00 278.85 305.72| 1,834.32
18 audio extractor, Crestron, QM-AE 4 368.00 CCS Presentation 368.00 1,472.00 394.68 428.01| 1,712.04
19 matrix switcher 8 x8, Crestron, QM- 1
MD8X8 2,105.00] CCS Presentation 2,105.00 2,105.00| 2,257.61 2,445.78| 2,445.78
20 quick media receiver for projector, 5
Crestron, QM-RX 684.00) CCS Presentation 684.00 3,420.00 733.59 794.88| 3,974.40
21 Transmitters, Crestron, QM-TX 5 578.00) CCS Presentation 578.00 2,890.00 619.91 672.59| 3,362.95
22 quick media input panel, Crestron, 5
QM-WMC 578.00) CCS Presentation 578.00 2,890.00 619.91 672.59| 3,362.95
23 rack mount kit for Touch Panel, 1
Crestron, RMK-3100L 157.00) CCS Presentation 157.00 157.00 168.38 183.43 183.43
24 Bi directional interface, Crestron, ST- 1
COM 368.00 CCS Presentation 368.00 368.00 394.68 428.01 428.01
25 rack kit for QM-AE, Crestron, ST- 4
RMK 78.00 CCS Presentation 78.00 312.00 83.66 91.72 366.88
26 touch panel for equipment rack, 1
Crestron, TPS3100L 1,999.00 CCS Presentation 1,999.00 1,999.00| 2,143.93 2,323.49 2,323.49
27 power amplifiers, Crown, CST1200 2 854.00] CCS Presentation 854.00 1,708.00 915.92 1,057.13| 2,114.26 910.00
28 multi channel 70V power amp, 1
Crown, CTS8200 1,563.00 CCS Presentation 1,563.00 1,563.00 1,676.32 1,932.66| 1,932.66 1,660.00
29 Tensioned Cosmopolitan Electrol 87" 2
X 116" screens motorized, Da-Lite,
##76730L 1,635.00) CCS Presentation 1,635.00 3,270.00| 1,753.54 2,021.44| 4,042.88 1,780.00
30 CD Changer, Denon DCM290P 1
VSA $13.68
only 1 Low
211.32]quote Troxell 225.00 225.00 241.31 250.66 250.66|DCM-290P 225.00
31 Speaker, JBL, 25T-WH 6
108.42] Full Compass 108.42 650.52 116.28 129.14 774.84 120.00
32 Speaker, Classroom Speakers, JBL, 10
28T60-WH
175.00) CCS Presentation 175.00 1,750.00 187.69 209.85( 2,098.50 190.00
33 antenna for ALS, Listen, LA-122 1 62.00 CCS Presentation 62.00 62.00 66.50 70.74 70.74 70.00
34 ear speakers, Listen, LA-164 16 10.19 PCD 10.19 163.04 10.93 11.13 178.08 20.00
35 charger case, Listen, LA-325 1 AV Center
$1.00 only 2
440.00}low quote CCS Presentation 441.00 441.00 472.97 512.70 512.70 440.00
36 rack kit, Listen, LA-326 1 42.00 CCS Presentation 42.00 42.00 45.05 47.69 47.69 50.00
37 rechargeable batteries, Listen, LA- 16
362 7.27| PCD 7.27 116.32 7.80 7.94 127.04! 13.50
38 receivers, Listen, LR-300 16 75.00) CCS Presentation 75.00 1,200.00 80.44 87.13| 1,394.08 85.00
39 transmitter assisted listening, Listen, 1 AV Center tied
LT-800 only 2 low
470.00]quote CCS Presentation 470.00 470.00 504.08 547.67 547.67 470.00
40 modules, Middle Atlantic, M201G 2 38.00 CompView 38.00 76.00 40.76 48.43 96.86|M-201G 53.00
41 modules, Middle Atlantic, M2X201G 1 44.00) CompView 44.00 44.00 47.19 54.77 54.77 59.00
42 power raceway, Middle Atlantic, 1
MPR-9 29.77 PCD 29.77 29.77 31.93 37.37 37.37 43.00
43 modules, Middle Atlantic, RLM20IG 4 pradiey5:02
only 1 low
63.94]quote Full Compass 63.96 255.84 68.60 78.51 314.04 80.00
44 equipment rack 46 space (overall 1
101 1/4" high), Middle Atlantic, SR-
46-28 801.00| CompView 801.00 801.00 859.07 972.70 972.70 930.00
45 sequencer, Middle Atlantic, USC-6R 1 299.00] CompView 299.00 299.00 320.68 391.22 391.22 360.00
46 mic input plate, RDL, DXLR3F 6 11.64 Full Compass 11.64 69.84/ 12.48 13.32 79.92 22.00
47 Transformers, RDL, TX-J2 1 40.58| Full Compass 40.58 40.58 43.52 49.96 49.96 55.00
48 projectors, Sharp, XGC-465X 2 2,719.00] Troxell 2,719.00 5,438.00] 2,916.13 3,789.74|  7,579.48
49 wireless antenna combiner, Shure, 1
UA221 107.00) CCS Presentation 107.00 107.00 114.76 123.24 123.24
50 wireless mic system Hand Held, 2
Shure, ULXP24Beta58 663.75) Troxell 663.75 1,327.50 711.87 943.01| 1,886.02
51 Speakers, Soundtube, RS500i 27 163.00] CCS Presentation 163.00 4,401.00 174.82 189.55| 5,117.85
52 Loudspeakers, Soundtube, RS600i 15
226.00) CompView 226.00 3,390.00 242.39 271.48| 4,072.20!
53 DSP expansion unit, BSS Soundweb 1 $2546.06 If
BLU 32 loaded with (2) BLUCARD - CobraNet is not
IN input cards and (2) BLUCARD - required, you can
OUT output cards use a BSS
BLU120 with (2)
BLUCARD- IN
and (2)
2,401.00 CompView 2,401.00 2,401.00| 2,575.07|BLUCARD- OUT 0.00!
54 DSP 8 X 8 mixer, BSS Soundweb 1 $3157.51 If
BLU8BO Loaded with (2) BLUCARD - CobraNet is not
IN input cards and (2) BLUCARD - required, you can
OUT output cards use a BSS
BLU160 with (2)
BLUCARD- IN
and (2)
3,590.00 CompView 3,590.00 3,590.00| 3,850.28|/BLUCARD- OUT 0.00
55 Cameras (include mount bracket), 2 Camera with Tile
WolfVision, EYE-10 Bridge incl.
Plenum Housing
2,416.00 CompView 2,416.00 4,832.00( 2,591.16|for EYE-10/12 3,090.25| 6,180.50

68,603.30




Company Bradley-Mathews Company CCS Presentation Systems|Company CompView Company|Full Compass Company PCD Inc.
wski Name Jerry Athey| Name Ryan Law | Name Cynthia Washburn Name|Eric Radej Name John Rudolph
35 Phone # 800.732.7665 Phone # 408-545-0555 x14 Phone # 877.297.2078 Phone #|800.356.5844 Phone # 707.546.3633
Bid or Quotation # 360846
Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total
0.00 152.00 456.00|no bid 0.00 191.00 573.00 146.51 439.53 145.60 436.80
0.00 83.00] 166.00(no bid 0.00 60.00] 120.00 52.62 105.24 62.72 125.44
0.00|ATPLATE-052 19.00 19.00|no bid 0.00 17.00 17.00 14.76 14.76 16.18 16.18
14.23+15.97+21.
0.00(23+21.23 72.66 72.66|no bid 0.00 65.00] 65.00] 40.15 40.15 61.58 61.58
Superceded by
Discontinued DS-16F-WHITE
0.00 0.00(DS16F 65.00 260.00 72.00] 288.00((043054) 60.44 241.76 63.25 253.00
260.00 0.00 125.00 250.00 123.00 246.00 138.50 277.00 153.23 306.46
0.00 0.00 1,421.00 1,421.00 1,487.00 1,487.00 1,539.00 1,539.00 1,512.00f 1,512.00
0.00 0.00 136.00 680.00 145.00 725.00 148.20 741.00 145.60 728.00
0.00 0.00 157.00 157.00 169.00 169.00 171.00 171.00 168.00 168.00
0.00 0.00 78.00 78.00 85.00] 85.00] 85.50 85.50 84.00 84.00
0.00 0.00 789.00 789.00 830.00 830.00 855.00 855.00 840.00 840.00
0.00 0.00 236.00 236.00 251.00 251.00 256.50 256.50 252.00 252.00
0.00 0.00 79.00 79.00 85.00] 85.00] 85.50 85.50 84.00 84.00
0.00 0.00 263.00 1,578.00 291.00 1,746.00 285.00 1,710.00 252.00( 1,512.00
0.00 0.00 6.00 30.00 7.00 35.00] 5.70 28.50 5.60 28.00
0.00 0.00 52.00 260.00 55.00] 275.00 57.00 285.00 56.00 280.00
0.00 0.00 263.00 1,578.00 291.00 1,746.00 285.00 1,710.00 280.00| 1,680.00
0.00 0.00 368.00 1,472.00 397.00 1,588.00 399.00 1,596.00 392.00| 1,568.00
0.00 0.00 2,105.00 2,105.00 2,195.00 2,195.00 2,280.00 2,280.00 2,240.00( 2,240.00
0.00 0.00 684.00 3,420.00 715.00 3,575.00 741.00 3,705.00 728.00| 3,640.00
0.00 0.00 578.00 2,890.00 607.00 3,035.00 627.00 3,135.00 616.00| 3,080.00
0.00 0.00 578.00 2,890.00 609.00 3,045.00 627.00 3,135.00 616.00| 3,080.00
0.00 0.00 157.00 157.00 173.00 173.00 171.00 171.00 168.00 168.00
0.00 0.00 368.00 368.00 390.00 390.00 399.00 399.00 392.00 392.00
0.00 0.00 78.00 312.00 85.00] 340.00 85.50 342.00 84.00 336.00
0.00 0.00 1,999.00 1,999.00 2,085.00 2,085.00 2,166.00 2,166.00 2,128.00f 2,128.00
1,820.00|CTS-1200 959.00 1,918.00 854.00 1,708.00 CTS1200 940.00 1,880.00 887.75 1,775.50 994.75| 1,989.50
1,660.00|CTS-8200A 1,739.00 1,739.00 1,563.00 1,563.00 1,710.00 1,710.00 1,623.00 1,623.00 1,818.15 1,818.15
3,560.00 0.00 1,635.00 3,270.00 1,840.00 3,680.00 1,900.95 3,801.90 1,968.24 3,936.48
225.00{DCM290P 238.00 238.00 235.00 235.00 232.00 232.00|DCM290P 228.67 228.67 235.75 235.75
Sold as Pairs
only 3 Pairs MUST ORDER
720.00{quoted @265/pr 132.50 795.00 110.00 660.00 111.00 666.00|QTY 6 108.42 650.52 118.45 710.70
Sold as Pairs
only 5 Pairs
1,900.00|quoted @425/pr 212.50 2,125.00 175.00 1,750.00 180.00 1,800.00 176.19 1,761.90 192.05 1,920.50
70.00 65.94] 65.94 62.00 62.00 68.00] 68.00] 64.79 64.79 64.96 64.96
320.00 10.37 165.92 11.00 176.00 12.00 192.00 10.92 174.72 10.19 163.04
440.00 477.94 477.94 441.00 441.00 465.00 465.00 494.72 494.72 469.56 469.56
50.00 44.46 44.46 42.00 42.00 45.00 45.00 46.80 46.80 43.68 43.68
Sold as
216.00 7.39 118.24 8.00 128.00(pairs$8/pr 8.00 128.00 7.79 124.64 7.27 116.32
1,360.00|LR-300-072 81.22 1,299.52 75.00 1,200.00 83.00 1,328.00 82.65 1,322.40 79.80[ 1,276.80
470.00|LR-800-072-01 510.54 510.54 470.00 470.00 499.00 499.00 519.51 519.51 501.76 501.76
106.00 39.43 78.86 43.00 86.00 38.00] 76.00] 39.46 78.92 51.52 103.04
59.00 44.59 44.59 48.00 48.00 44.00 44.00 46.44 46.44 47.66 47.66
43.00 39.43 39.43 32.00 32.00 35.00] 35.00] 30.44 30.44 29.77 29.77
320.00 63.94] 255.76 69.00 276.00 65.00] 260.00 63.96 255.84 99.25 397.00
Via truck loading
930.00{dock 993.00 993.00 870.00 870.00 801.00 801.00 978.35 978.35 860.73 860.73
360.00 318.63 318.63 349.00 349.00 299.00 299.00 318.73 318.73 347.20 347.20
132.00 15.34 92.04 12.00 72.00 13.00 78.00] 11.64 69.84 12.51 75.06
55.00 53.00] 53.00 44.00 44.00 49.00 49.00 40.58 40.58 46.89 46.89
0.00 0.00|no bid 0.00(N/B 0.00(**no bid** 0.00 2,800.00( 5,600.00
0.00 112.00 112.00 107.00 107.00 120.00 120.00 115.85 115.85 115.90 115.90
0.00 745.00 1,490.00 766.00 1,532.00 811.00 1,622.00 716.52 1,433.04 931.14| 1,862.28
0.00 0.00 163.00 4,401.00 173.00 4,671.00|**no bid** 0.00 193.00( 5,211.00
Spec Black or
0.00 0.00 233.00 3,495.00|white 226.00 3,390.00(**no bid** 0.00 284.00| 4,260.00
BLU32+(4)BLU
CARD-IN +
(4)BLUCARD-
0.00 0.00|no bid 0.00 2,401.00 2,401.00(0UT 3,105.23 3,105.23 2,415.30[ 2,415.30
0.00 0.00|no bid 0.00 3,590.00 3,590.00 3,662.97 3,662.97 3,884.65| 3,884.65
0.00 0.00 2,585.00 5,170.00 2,416.00 4,832.00{**no bid** 0.00 2,445.30( 4,890.60
15,076.00 13,688.53 51,196.00 60,130.00 48,239.74 68,393.74




Company Sesco Data Systems Company|SOUND EXPRESSIONS |Company Troxell Communications Company|VSA, INC
Name Mike Hussey| Name|A. NAKAMURA Name Bruce Williams Name|MARTY SHRADER
Phone # 800.441.0230 Phone #|707-528-3565 Phone # 925.335.9408 Phone #|800-888-2140
Bid or Quotation # 11136 Bid or Quotation #|BID PRICING
Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total Comments Each Total
0.00 0.00 0.00 146.81 440.43
75.12 150.24 81.16 162.32 68.00 136.00:! 0.00
ATPLATE-
21.81 21.81|052 18.85 18.85 21.50 21.50 0.00
58.12 58.12|set 78.91 78.91 62.50 62.50 0.00
0.00 0.00 96.50 386.00 0.00
0.00 192.20 384.40 133.00 266.00 123.60 247.20
0.00 0.00 1,435.00( 1,435.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 139.50 697.50 0.00
0.00 0.00 160.60 160.60:! 0.00
0.00 0.00 85.50 85.50 0.00
0.00 0.00 798.50 798.50 0.00
0.00 0.00 245.00 245.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 85.50 85.50 0.00
0.00 0.00 285.00( 1,710.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 6.00 30.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 55.25 276.25 0.00
0.00 0.00 260.00[ 1,560.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 377.00( 1,508.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 2,115.00| 2,115.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 692.00( 3,460.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 587.00[ 2,935.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 585.50[ 2,927.50 0.00
0.00 0.00 164.50 164.50! 0.00
0.00 0.00 377.00 377.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 86.75 347.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 2,008.00| 2,008.00 0.00
1,159.22( 2,318.44(CTS 1200 1,107.60[ 2,215.20 934.00( 1,868.00{CTS1200 868.20| 1,736.40
2,112.71] 2,112.71|CTS 8200A 1,996.79( 1,996.79 1,683.00( 1,683.00 1,593.64( 1,593.64
2,037.13| 4,074.26 2,166.46| 4,332.92 1,739.00( 3,478.00 1,809.87( 3,619.74
DCM-290P
(280
DISCONTIN
298.76 298.76|UED) 273.16 273.16 225.00 225.00 211.32 211.32
CONTROL25
0.00|T 140.42 842.52|Must be 6 118.50 711.00 109.62 657.72
CONTROL28
0.00|T-60 221.93( 2,219.30 190.00( 1,900.00 179.22( 1,792.20
83.64 83.64 77.44 77.44 65.85 65.85 64.26 64.26
23.17 370.72 12.24 195.84 10.55 168.80! 12.07 193.12

572.01 572.01|LA-325-01 537.77 537.77 448.50 448.50 452.16 452.16
59.22 59.22 52.17 52.17 47.50 47.50 45.62 45.62
13.87 221.92 10.52 168.32 7.55 120.80|(for 2 each) 9.56 152.96

101.08| 1,617.28(LR-300-072 93.99| 1,503.84 80.60| 1,289.60 81.06| 1,296.96

LT-800-072-

611.55 611.55|01 563.09 563.09 477.00 477.00 479.62 479.62
46.56 93.12 56.41 112.82 49.50 99.00|M-201G 47.44 94.88
67.98 67.98 63.16 63.16 55.56 55.56|M-2X201G 53.10 53.10
36.24 36.24 44.68 44.68 42.50 42.50 44.10 44.10
73.67 294.68 88.35 353.40 77.00 308.00 76.55 306.20

905.12 905.12 1,182.32| 1,182.32 1,195.00f 1,195.00 1,070.52| 1,070.52

393.93 393.93 419.96 419.96 361.00 361.00 354.57 354.57

0.00 0.00 12.00 72.00|D-XLR3F 14.63 87.78

0.00 0.00 42.50 42.50 47.17 47.17

0.00 0.00 2,719.00| 5,438.00 0.00

127.19 127.19 132.46 132.46 113.00 113.00! 108.64 108.64
856.52( 1,713.04 1,011.97( 2,023.94 663.75[ 1,327.50 699.61| 1,399.22
0.00 0.00 170.35[ 4,599.45 0.00

0.00 0.00 242.50( 3,637.50 0.00

0.00 3,131.33| 3,131.33 0.00 0.00

0.00 4,672.61| 4,672.61 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

16,201.98 27,759.52 53,571.91 16,549.53




