
Nikon Coolpix 4800
Non-Compliant to Specificatio

 Winning Lowest Responsive 

Item Desc Qt Auto Pick LOW Item Awarded to: ea line
1 Camera 4.0 Megapixels 8.3X Optical, 

Coolpix 4800 Digital NIKO #25520
1

340.00 0.00
2 Li-ion Battery, EN-EL1 Rechargeable 

NIKON #9895
1

25.95 0.00
3 Camera Bag, D-Res 30AW LOWEPR 

#1943010
1

18.00 0.00
4 (SD) Card,  128MB Secure Digital 

SANDISK # SDSDB-128-A10
1

21.55 0.00
5  Stereo Headphone, 6' Shielded Cord, 

Labtec LT 810 # LT810REXW
12

5.00 0.00
6 Audio Splitter Cable, (1) 3.5mm Stereo 

Male to (2) 3.5mm Stereo Female
6

2.00 0.00
412.50 0.00



Company Shutterbug Company Troxell
on Name Name Bruce Williams
 Vendor Phone # Phone # (800)578-8858 x430

Price ea with Tax
Budget 2002-
2003 Desc./ Exception Each Total

Desc./ 
Exception Each Total

0.00 No Bid 0.00 359.00 359.00

0.00 No Bid 0.00 25.95 25.95

0.00 No Bid 0.00 24.95 24.95

0.00 No Bid 0.00 25.00 25.00

0.00 No Bid 0.00 9.50 114.00

0.00 No Bid 0.00 2.95 17.70
0.00 500 0.00 566.60



Company CDW-G Company Gov Connection
Name Craig Lance Name Bill Fleck
Phone # 800 808-4239 Phone # 800 998-0001

Desc./ 
Exception Each Total

Desc./ 
Exception Each Total

340.00 340.00 352.00 352.00

27.06 27.06 28.00 28.00

NB 0.00 18.00 18.00

21.55 21.55 23.00 23.00

5.00 60.00 6.00 72.00

0.00 2.00 12.00
448.61 505.00


