DVD CAMCORDER

Non-Complia

nt to Specificati

(

Winning Lowest Responsive

ltem Desc Qt  Auto Pick LOW Item Awarded to: [ea line

1/Sony DCR-DVD101 0 671.00} 0.00
2|Panasonic VDR-M70 2 675.00] Troxell Comm 675.00 1,350.00
3[Panasonic VDR-M50 0 625.00] 0.00
4|Panasonic Battery CGA-DU21A/1B 2 61.50] Troxell Comm 61.50 123.00
5/Sony Battery NP-QM71D 0 66.50] 0.00

6|Sony DVD Handycam Accessory Kit ACC- 0
DVDM 55.5080 0.00

7|Single-sided 30 minute (1.4GB) DVD-R 25
Disc for DVD Camcorders 3.07] Northern Video 3.07 76.75
2,157.57, 1,549.75




Company Full Compass Company Troxell Comm Inc
on Name George Wirtanen Name Bruce Williams
Vendor Phone # Phone # 925 335-9408
Budget 2002- Desc./
Price ea with Tax [2003 Desc./ Exception Each Total Exception Each Total
0.00 0.00 692.00 0.00
723.94 706.14 1,412.28 675.00 1,350.00
0.00 648.59 0.00 625.00 0.00
65.96 78.00 156.00 61.50 123.00
0.00 0.00 66.50 0.00
0.00 0.00 59.50 0.00
3.29 0.00 3.75 93.75
793.19 500 1,568.28 1,566.75




Company ATV Video Company [Columbia Video Company CDW-G
Name Jon Bryant Name Bruce Berg | Name Craig Lance
Phone # 888 973-9149 Phone # 800 356-2188 Phone # 800 808-4239
Desc./ Desc./ Desc./
Exception Each Total Exception Each Total Exception Each Total
766.25 0.00 671.00 0.00f Not FOB 674.49 0.00
740.00 1,480.00 687.00 1,374.00] Not FOB 715.25 1,430.50
684.00 0.00 631.00 0.00f Not FOB 649.60 0.00
69.40 138.80 69.00 138.00] Not FOB 86.41 172.82
109.00 0.00 98.00 0.00f Not FOB 68.48 0.00
59.00 0.00 55.50 0.00] Not FOB 57.57 0.00
6.29 157.25 0.00(5 pak 17.17 3.43 85.85
1,776.05 1,512.00| Add shipping 29.40 1,718.57




Company Northern Video Company Bradley Broadcast Company Cal Media Solutions Company
Name ?? Scribbled Name Jerry Athey Name Angie Hatfield Name
Phone # 800 368-4472 Phone # 800 732-7665 Phone # 888-881-8273 Phone #
Desc./ Desc./ Desc./ Desc./
Exception Each Total Exception Total Exception Each Total Exception
789.00 0.00 877.00 0.00 694.90 0.00
774.00 1,548.00(No Bid 0.00 696.00 1,392.00
703.00 0.00|No Bid 0.00 644.00 0.00
70.00 140.00(No Bid 0.00 69.29 138.58
70.00 0.00 78.00 0.00 70.49 0.00
60.00 0.00 68.00 0.00 59.90 0.00
3.07 76.75|No Bid 0.00 5.59 139.75
1,764.75 0.00 1,670.33




VMI

Michael Mitchel

916 369-6911

Each Total
723.00 0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
73.00 0.00
63.00 0.00
3.63 90.75

90.75




